
BISI Summer Camp – “BISI Summer Games” Week

Let the games begin! 🏅 ⚽ 🏀 🏊 


This week, BISI Summer Camp transforms into a dynamic and 
spirited arena for our action-packed “BISI Summer Games”! 
Campers will feel the excitement of international competition as they 


join teams representing different countries, complete with flags, 
friendly rivalries, and a celebration of effort, teamwork, and fun!


Campers will kick off the week by creating their team’s national flag 
in art class, then head into a wide variety of high-energy 
competitions and collaborative challenges. Points will be earned 
throughout the week for creativity, sportsmanship, team spirit, and, 
of course, winning events!
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.    Competitive and Creative Highlights

	 

	 BISI Football Cup ⚽ 

Teams battle it out in our signature football tournament, where 
passion and playmaking collide!

	 Swimming Races & Relays 🏊 🏁 

Classic swim challenges and creative water games designed to test 
speed, teamwork, and endurance.

	 Basketball Showdowns 🏀 

High-energy matches with dribbling, teamwork, and big moments on 
the court.

	 Table Tennis Tournament 🏓 

Fast-paced one-on-one or doubles matches for campers who love a 
bit of spin and strategy.

	 Ultimate Team Challenges 🤝 💪 

Relays, obstacle courses, and tug-of-war style games that put 
collaboration and communication to the test.


	 Treasure Hunt Quest 🗺 🔍 

A thrilling group adventure where teams race to solve clues, unlock 
codes, and discover hidden surprises around the camp!




	 Design Your National Flag 🎨 🌍 

Campers work together in art class to design bold, meaningful flags 
that represent their team’s identity and values.


	 Make Your Own Medals & Trophies 🏅 ✨ 

Using craft materials, glitter, and imagination, campers will create 
personalized awards to honor their achievements.


Edible Medal Workshop 🍪 🥇 

A delicious twist! Campers will make cookie medals decorated with 
icing and strung on long jelly candy strings — fun to wear, even 
more fun to eat!


Each day builds on team bonding, excitement, and goal-setting — 
leading up to the epic BISI Summer Games Closing Ceremony! 
With music, podium moments, cheers, and cookie medals in hand, 
every camper will leave the week feeling like a true champion.
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